
 
P3-5 Literacy Tasks 

Week Beginning 04.05.20 
 Listening   
 
Tune in to hear David Walliams reading a 
chapter from one of his books every day!  
 
https://www.worldofdavidwalliams.com/eleve
nses/ 
 
Check the literacy section of the P3-5 home 
learning page. Find the date and complete the 
job that matches the story that you listened to!  
 

Writing 
 
Instructions:  
 
I know lots of you have been busy in the 
kitchen at home so your writing task this week 
is to write a set of instructions about 
something you have made. This could be how 
to make ice lollies, a cake, a 
sandwich…anything you’ve been making in the 
kitchen!  
 
Haven’t been busy in the kitchen but you have 
been busy in the garden? Write a set of 
instructions for how to plant a seed, how to 
build a fairy den, how to build a bug hotel…or 
anything else you have been building outside!  
 
Remember that a clear set of instructions:  

• Is numbered or written in the correct 
time sequence 

• Uses clear and simple language (easy to 
understand)  

• Uses bossy verbs to give direct 
instructions- collect this, do that  

• Has diagrams to support the readers 
understanding  

 
Share your instructions on the blog once you 
are finished and see if other people find them 
easy to follow!  

Reading 
 
Spend at least 30 minutes a day reading a 
book. This could be a book you borrowed from 
school, a book from home or a book on EPIC!  
 
When you have finished a book remember to 
post a book review on the blog. Your review 
might encourage others to give the book a go if 
they like the sound of it.  

Spelling  
 
Work out your spelling for a short amount of 
time every day this week!  
 
Play lots of spelling games with your family. 
Has anybody created their own spelling game 
that they could share with others on the blog?  
 
Remember that all of the wordlists are on the 
blog. When you are ready move onto the next 
wordlist for more of a challenge!   

Quick Writing 

 
Get a timer ready with 15 minutes set. Start 
the timer and try to write as many sentences 
as you can about the topic! Try to tell me 
everything you know about the topic. 
 
On the first day of quick writing you may only 
be able to write a few sentences, but hopefully 
the more you try quick writing the more you 
will be able to write in the time limit.  
 
Here are some topics you could try writing 
about this week:  
 

• Your favourite toy  

• Your favourite sport  

• Your favourite vehicle  

• Your favourite food  

• Your favourite school subject  
 
 

Talking- KiVa 
 
The first KiVa rule is ‘No one is excluded’. Have 
a chat with your family, what does that mean? 
Can you think of some examples where you 
made everybody feel included? Have you let 
siblings join in with games/baking/planting? 

https://www.worldofdavidwalliams.com/elevenses/
https://www.worldofdavidwalliams.com/elevenses/

